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DISABILITY WAIVER 
 
If you have had twelve consecutive months of eligibility through Employer contributions 
and become disabled, the Trust will continue your eligibility and maintain benefits as 
they were immediately prior to the date of the disability.  
 
During your disability, you must file a Disability Waiver claim with the Trust Fund Office 
before the end of each month in which you did not work at least 80 covered hours. Your 
eligibility will be provided on a month-to-month basis, subject to your filing of the 
required Disability Waiver form.  
 
Coverage by Disability Waiver is provided on a lag month basis. The month of eligibility 
is the second month following the month of disability in which you did not work at least 
80 hours.  
 
The Trust Fund Office will notify you of the Plan's determination as to your eligibility for 
Disability Waiver within a reasonable period of time appropriate to your medical 
circumstances but in no case later than 45 days after receipt of the claim. The Board of 
Trustees may grant as to timeliness a waiver for substantial compelling reasons, which 
constitute good cause.  
 
For non-work-related disabilities, a maximum of six months of Disability Waiver 
coverage applies. After this six months of Disability Waiver coverage, you may make up 
to 18 self-payments under the Plan's COBRA provisions. Thereafter, you may qualify for 
up to six final Disability Waivers. The maximum period for all combined non-
occupational disability periods is 30 months, i.e. the initial six month period, the 18 
selfpayments, and the six final waivers.  
 
For work-related disabilities, a maximum of twelve months of Disability Waiver 
coverage applies. After this twelve-month period, you may make up to 18 self-payments 
under the Plan's COBRA provisions. The maximum period is 30 months, i.e. the initial 
twelve-month period of Disability Waiver and the 18 self-payments.  
 
If you have been granted the maximum Disability Waiver months noted above, you will 
not again be eligible for Disability Waiver until you have again worked 12 consecutive 
months for contributing Employers.  
 
For a Retiree who was previously eligible for Disability Waiver as an Active Employee, 
up to a maximum of six Disability Waivers are provided if the Retiree is disabled, not yet 
age 65 and not yet eligible for Medicare. 
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